INFORMATION HANDOUT

For Contract No. 10-1C4504
At 10-Mer-59,152-Var

Identified by
Project ID 1015000026

MATERIALS INFORMATION

Water Source Information



Dang, Chin@DOT

“rom: Kevin Padway [kpadway@mercedid.org]
ent: Friday, March 13, 2015 5:10 PM
To: Dang, Chin@DOT
Cc: Scott Porter
Subject: RE: EA 10-1C450 Cold Plane and replace with HMA - requesting water source information
Attachments: Permit for non-irrigation water use.pdf
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: Red Category
Hi Chin,

As discussed in our phone conversation MID does have construction water available on a case by case basis. Typically, if
we have water in our canals we make that available for construction uses.

In regards to your project on 152 and 59 we do have several canals in El Nido. If we have water in the canals during the
time of the project (April 2016) it would be available assuming the pickup location is coordinated with MID. | have
attached our application for construction water. As described in the permit we require a $1,000 deposit and we charge
$200/acre foot (1 AF=326,000 gallons). MID does require a way to calculate the volume of water used (flow meter,
counting water trucks filled, etc.). The estimated use of your project, 150,000 gallons, is about % an AF.

The project is still a year out so it is hard for us to tell if surface water will be in the canals at that time so MID cannot
“uarantee this availability. It is dependent upon when we start our irrigation season and the amount of surface water
Jllocation (if any) we will have. As | mentioned earlier MID does not have any surface water available for 2015. The best
thing to do would be contact MID next January to get more information on the availability.

If you have any questions please let me know.

Regards,
Kevin

From: Dang, Chin@DOT [mailto:Chin.Dang@dot.ca.gov]

Sent: Friday, March 13, 2015 4:54 PM

To: Kevin Padway

Subject: EA 10-1C450 Cold Plane and replace with HMA - requesting water source information

Hi Kevin,
It was great talking to you on the phone a few minutes ago. Very much appreciate your quick response to this request.

As mentioned earlier, please provide the available water source information including any fees, for the potential water
source closest to Route 152 from Post Miles R8.0/R40.9 ( near Rte 5 and Rte 59).

Thank you in advance for your assistance with Caltrans projects.
cooking forward to working with you on this safety project.

Chin Dang, PE



Office of Design, Branch H
Caltrans District 10-Stockton, Ca
209-948-7754



. /mittee (Company Name)
Mailing Address:

City, State, Zip:

Telephone:

Contractor's License No.:

Project Name;
Project Owner:
City, State, Zip:

Location of Take-Out
Section/Township/Range:
Canal/Lateral Name/Area:
Type of Take-Out:

Water Use:

MERCED IRRIGATON DISTRICT
PERMIT FOR NON-IRRIGATION WATER USE

Estimated Water Use/Day (Gallons):
Estimated Time of Water Use (Days).
Total Estimate Water Use (GAL x Days):

Signature of Permittee Agent: Date:

TERMS FOR WATER USE

$200.00 Permit Fee. The Permit Fee entitles the permittee to 1.00 acre foot of water or 326,000 galions.
Additional amounts shall be at a cost of $200.00/Unit (1.00 AF).

Permitiee must present proposal for MID approval as to the method the water will be removed from

the canal/lateral.

No MID pump water shall be available for construction purposes, except under extreme circumstances
and with the written permission of the MID Manager.

An annual $1000.00 Deposit will be necessary at the issuance of the permit. After the completion of the work,
The permittee will restore, to MiD's satisfaction, the MID right of way to it's original condition. At

that time, the $800.00 will be refunded to the permittee. In the event damage is done o MID

facilities or the right of way is not restored, the MID shall use any or all of the deposit for necessary
repairs or restoration, The permitiee shall also be responsible for any additional costs, in excess

of the deposit, if additional work is required.

The MID assumes no responsibility with respect {o the quality of water {0 be furnished pumuant to

this Contract and does not warrant the quality of any such water.

Permittee agrees to indemnify the MID and will save the MID free, clear and harmless from any
damage, damages, claims, demands, liability, costs and expenses, regardiess of nature, that may be
sustained, caused or suffered by the MID as a result of the use of the MID canal/leteral right of way

and or the use of MID water,

Title: Amount Paid:




From: Dang. Chin@DOT

To: Chouang, Christy@DOT

Cc: Reyes, Caroline M@DOT

Subject: FW: 10-1C4501 DOE Secondary Review #1 (Set 2)
Date: Friday, August 21, 2015 2:13:25 PM
Attachments: Correspondence with MID.pdf

Christy,

See attached conversation with Kevin Padway at MID.

Kevin Padway

kpadway@mercedid.org
(209) 722-5761

Chin Dang, PE
209-948-7754

From: Chouang, Christy@DOT

Sent: Friday, August 21, 2015 10:30 AM

To: Dang, Chin@DOT

Subject: RE: 10-1C4501 DOE Secondary Review #1 (Set 2)

For Info Handout, need to see that a request was sent to company in a correspondence form.
Thank you,

Christy Chouang
District Office Engineer Reviewer
(559) 244-2985

From: Dang, Chin@DOT

Sent: Thursday, August 20, 2015 10:00 AM

To: Chouang, Christy@DOT

Cc: Reyes, Caroline M@DOT; ROCCANOVA, JOHN@DOT,; Dunajski, Sarah@DOT; Castro, John L@DOT
Subject: RE: 10-1C4501 DOE Secondary Review #1 (Set 2)

Hi Christy,

1. Attached email is the recommendation from Jag Brar (Traffic Safety Branch) for variation in
width and locations of rumble strips.
2. Provide Funding Summary — | believe John Roccanova (PM) will provide this to you.

3. Cost Cert —In route for second time to get signatures, after 2" OF review. | will send to you
once signatures are received.
4. NSSP approvals:


mailto:/O=MMS/OU=EXCHANGE ADMINISTRATIVE GROUP (FYDIBOHF23SPDLT)/CN=RECIPIENTS/CN=DANG, CHIN@DO9077D924-6F61-471D-9BC3-757365DACC94424
mailto:christy.chouang@dot.ca.gov
mailto:caroline.reyes@dot.ca.gov
mailto:kpadway@mercedid.org

Dang, Chin@DOT

“rom: Kevin Padway [kpadway@mercedid.org]
ent: Friday, March 13, 2015 5:10 PM
To: Dang, Chin@DOT
Cc: Scott Porter
Subject: RE: EA 10-1C450 Cold Plane and replace with HMA - requesting water source information
Attachments: Permit for non-irrigation water use.pdf
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged
Categories: Red Category
Hi Chin,

As discussed in our phone conversation MID does have construction water available on a case by case basis. Typically, if
we have water in our canals we make that available for construction uses.

In regards to your project on 152 and 59 we do have several canals in El Nido. If we have water in the canals during the
time of the project (April 2016) it would be available assuming the pickup location is coordinated with MID. | have
attached our application for construction water. As described in the permit we require a $1,000 deposit and we charge
$200/acre foot (1 AF=326,000 gallons). MID does require a way to calculate the volume of water used (flow meter,
counting water trucks filled, etc.). The estimated use of your project, 150,000 gallons, is about % an AF.

The project is still a year out so it is hard for us to tell if surface water will be in the canals at that time so MID cannot
“uarantee this availability. It is dependent upon when we start our irrigation season and the amount of surface water
Jllocation (if any) we will have. As | mentioned earlier MID does not have any surface water available for 2015. The best
thing to do would be contact MID next January to get more information on the availability.

If you have any questions please let me know.

Regards,
Kevin

From: Dang, Chin@DOT [mailto:Chin.Dang@dot.ca.gov]

Sent: Friday, March 13, 2015 4:54 PM

To: Kevin Padway

Subject: EA 10-1C450 Cold Plane and replace with HMA - requesting water source information

Hi Kevin,
It was great talking to you on the phone a few minutes ago. Very much appreciate your quick response to this request.

As mentioned earlier, please provide the available water source information including any fees, for the potential water
source closest to Route 152 from Post Miles R8.0/R40.9 ( near Rte 5 and Rte 59).

Thank you in advance for your assistance with Caltrans projects.
cooking forward to working with you on this safety project.

Chin Dang, PE





Office of Design, Branch H
Caltrans District 10-Stockton, Ca
209-948-7754





. /mittee (Company Name)
Mailing Address:

City, State, Zip:

Telephone:

Contractor's License No.:

Project Name;
Project Owner:
City, State, Zip:

Location of Take-Out
Section/Township/Range:
Canal/Lateral Name/Area:
Type of Take-Out:

Water Use:

MERCED IRRIGATON DISTRICT
PERMIT FOR NON-IRRIGATION WATER USE

Estimated Water Use/Day (Gallons):
Estimated Time of Water Use (Days).
Total Estimate Water Use (GAL x Days):

Signature of Permittee Agent: Date:

TERMS FOR WATER USE

$200.00 Permit Fee. The Permit Fee entitles the permittee to 1.00 acre foot of water or 326,000 galions.
Additional amounts shall be at a cost of $200.00/Unit (1.00 AF).

Permitiee must present proposal for MID approval as to the method the water will be removed from

the canal/lateral.

No MID pump water shall be available for construction purposes, except under extreme circumstances
and with the written permission of the MID Manager.

An annual $1000.00 Deposit will be necessary at the issuance of the permit. After the completion of the work,
The permittee will restore, to MiD's satisfaction, the MID right of way to it's original condition. At

that time, the $800.00 will be refunded to the permittee. In the event damage is done o MID

facilities or the right of way is not restored, the MID shall use any or all of the deposit for necessary
repairs or restoration, The permitiee shall also be responsible for any additional costs, in excess

of the deposit, if additional work is required.

The MID assumes no responsibility with respect {o the quality of water {0 be furnished pumuant to

this Contract and does not warrant the quality of any such water.

Permittee agrees to indemnify the MID and will save the MID free, clear and harmless from any
damage, damages, claims, demands, liability, costs and expenses, regardiess of nature, that may be
sustained, caused or suffered by the MID as a result of the use of the MID canal/leteral right of way

and or the use of MID water,

Title: Amount Paid:









